

Date	Client	Matters	Description	Cost Price	
02/17/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review html code of infringing website; clone infringing website; discuss strategy and best venue for lawsuit with E. Misterovich.	0.30	0
02/21/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Compare look and feel of websites at issue; discuss strategy regarding html code and look and feel of website with E. Misterovich; review Copyright Office rules.	0.60	0.60
02/28/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review html code for ffl123.com; prepare html code deposit copy for Copyright Office; prepare and file application with Copyright Office	0.00	[\$400.00]
02/28/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Research Copyright Office records for B. Maddox's prior registration; correspondence with B. Maddox; correspondence with E. Misterovich regarding complaint and temporary restraining order.	0.30	0.30
03/01/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Prepare and file copyright application for all files pulled from FFL123.com; upload compressed version of website to the Copyright Office; report copyright filing to B. Maddox.	0.00	[\$400.00]
03/02/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	research procedure for filing under seal in the Southern District of New York; research case law relevant to temporary restraining order, including freezing of assets, in the copyright context; draft memorandum in support of motion for temporary restraining order; phone call with E. Misterovich discussing research and strategy	3.40	3.40
03/03/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Research relevant case law and various claims; discuss strength of each proposed claim with E. Misterovich; review and revise Complaint; draft memorandum in support of motion for temporary restraining order.	5.40	5.40
03/06/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review case law and prepare memorandum in support of motion for temporary restraining order.	3.40	3.40
03/07/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review case law and draft memorandum in support of motion for temporary restraining order.	1.70	1.70
03/08/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review case law and draft memorandum in support of motion for temporary restraining order; phone call with E. Misterovich regarding strategy and filing under seal.	2.40	2.40

03/09/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Draft and revise memo supporting temporary restraining order; draft proposed temporary restraining order; draft application to file under seal.	9.70	9.70
03/10/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Research case law and procedure regarding sealing orders; draft proposed sealing order; review complaint and exhibits; revise legal memorandum.	7.10	7.10
03/11/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review all proposed orders, motions, memos, exhibits, and complaint; review all cited case law and statutory authority; revise proposed orders, motions, and memos.	8.70	8.70
03/12/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with E. Misterovich regarding freezing defendants' assets; draft discovery requests and subpoenas to third party financial providers.	3.80	3.80
03/13/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Revise memo and discuss with E. Misterovich.	5.20	5.20
03/14/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Finalize all documents for filing under seal with SDNY.	3.80	3.80
03/15/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with B. Maddox regarding next steps in litigation.	0.10	0.10
03/15/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	File application to file under seal; in-chambers meeting with Judge Cote arguing in favor of application to seal; initiating proceeding under seal pursuant to Judge Cote's order; meeting with Judge Abrams's clerk regarding motion for immediate injunctive relief, including freezing defendants' assets without notice.	3.00	3.00
03/15/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with Judge Abrams off the record regarding ex parte motion; correspond with EM regarding same.	0.30	0.30
03/16/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Research case law on freezing assets; correspond with client regarding strategy; phone call with EM regarding strategy.	3.60	3.60
03/17/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with B. Maddox; review evidence; legal research.	1.30	1.30

03/20/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review correspondence from client; look at notes on freezing foreign assets; correspond with B. Maddox.	0.40	0.40
03/24/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with B. Maddox regarding status of case and strategy.	0.30	0.30
03/27/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Draft supplemental brief and send to EM for review.	14.40	14.40
03/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Prepare for potential in-chambers argument supporting supplemental brief; file supplemental brief under seal at SDNY courthouse.	2.60	2.60
03/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review EM's revisions to supplemental brief; revise supplemental brief and prepare for filing under seal.	3.10	3.10
03/30/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review research notes and annotated cases for potential phone call from J. Abrams; correspond with client regarding status of matter.	1.40	1.40
04/26/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with client discussing status of matter.	0.70	0
04/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review memo and supplemental memo requesting TRO; phone call to chambers requesting update on Judge Abrams's decision; correspond with EM regarding same.	0.60	0
05/17/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with chambers regarding proposed TRO; review docket; telephonic hearing with J. Abrams regarding proposed TRO; phone call with EM and client regarding same.	2.60	2.60
05/24/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Revise proposed temporary restraining order using notes from hearing with Judge Abrams; file revised proposed order under seal in court house; correspond with EM regarding same.	3.60	3.60
05/30/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review signed order from Judge Abrams; prepare subpoenas; correspond with EM; phone call with B. Maddox regarding next steps.	0.50	0.50

05/31/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Courier deliveries to financial service providers in California.	1.00	\$242.69
05/31/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Courier deliveries to financial service providers in California.	1.00	\$285.00
05/31/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with client regarding bond to be posted with court; correspond with financial service providers; phone call with chambers; draft and email letter to Judge Abrams requesting extension of time to serve Defendants.	4.10	4.10
06/01/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with chambers discussing extension of deadline to serve defendants; review endorsed letter from Judge Abrams extending time to serve; discuss strategy with EM; phone calls to financial service providers served with Court order and discovery; correspondence with client regarding extension and bond; prepare and post bond at court house; phone calls and correspondence with financial service providers; phone call with client regarding next steps; prepare documents for service on defendants; correspondence with courier services in Australia and London to effect service.	9.20	0
06/02/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with EM to discuss service on defendants; phone call with chambers; correspondence with chambers regarding summonses for defendants; phone call with London-based couriers; research and preparation for hearing on order to show cause.	3.20	0
06/05/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review discovery documents provided by Stripe regarding infringing transactions; correspond with EM regarding Stripe's production; correspond with Stripe regarding document production; summarize Stripe production for hearing; correspond with client regarding email blast from FFLTRUST.com.	1.30	0
06/06/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Research and preparation for hearing on order to show cause; phone call from attorney in Australia regarding defendants' irrelevant cases; draft proposed preliminary injunction for J. Abrams; correspondence and phone call with PayPal regarding lack of production; attend hearing on order to show cause before J. Abrams; phone call with client discussing status of case and next steps.	9.50	5.00
06/07/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspond with client regarding PayPal; review Stripe documents and summary of documents; compute estimate of damages from Stripe accounts; correspond with EM regarding new email addresses and discovery in general.	0.70	0
06/08/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Prepare documents for service on defendants; review court order unsealing case; correspond with client regarding complaint.	0.60	0

06/12/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with chambers regarding docket; prepare and file docket entries after unsealing order.	1.50	0
06/13/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review and file supplemental memo with exhibits for court; review docket as per conversation with clerk.	0.20	0
06/15/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with in-house counsel for PayPal; discuss same with EM.	0.30	0
06/16/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with in-house counsel for PayPal; review materials provided by PayPal; discuss same with EM.	2.50	0
06/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with client regarding hearing and expected next steps; review last minute memorandum opposing our motion for a TRO; phone call with EM discussing strategic response to opposing counsel's last minute filing; phone call with client regarding strategy; correspondence with client gathering strategic exhibits to undermine Defendant Osoukie's fraudulent declaration; draft and file Reply to opposing counsel's last minute memorandum; prepare for hearing on TRO; correspond with client regarding hearing.	11.10	11.10
06/29/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone calls with EM and client regarding FBI and potential settlement; hearing before J. Abrams regarding TRO; discuss minimum settlement requirements with opposing counsel; phone calls with EM and client regarding result of hearing and next steps; review docket entry from Court.	4.00	4.00
07/04/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding infringing site being back up; download clone of infringing site; phone call with client.	0.20	0.20
07/05/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding settlement proposal; review order from J. Abrams; review AU lawsuit; review AU defamation law; discuss same with JAD and EM; phone call with client; draft and sent settlement proposal to opposing counsel.	1.50	1.50
07/05/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Subway passes and taxi to and from courthouse multiple times.	1.00	\$50.00
07/05/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Discuss matter with EM; correspond with client regarding potential settlement offer.	0.20	0.20

07/07/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review correspondence from Stripe; correspondence with client; review html code from infringing site for Stripe plugin; correspond with Stripe regarding subpoena.	0.50	0.50
07/13/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review counter offer from opposing counsel; discuss same with EM.	0.40	0.40
07/26/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review motion for TRO and Answer with Counterclaims filed by opposing counsel; discuss with EM.	2.10	2.10
07/27/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review and serve discovery documents on opposing counsel; draft reply brief and file with court; legal research in preparation for hearing.	5.70	5.70
07/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Prepare for and attend hearing on opposing counsel's motion for TRO; phone call with EM regarding same.	13.20	13.20
08/01/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Draft, revise, and serve subpoenas on opposing counsel and multiple ISPs; discuss same with EM.	0.50	0.50
08/02/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding joint letter requested at last hearing; discuss same with EM as well as next steps.	0.80	0.80
08/07/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review correspondence from client; discuss strategy with EM; draft Rule 11 memo.	0.40	0.40
08/09/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call from Vodafone regarding Rule 45 subpoena; draft Rule 11 memo; correspond with opposing counsel regarding extension of time to answer.	0.90	0.90
08/10/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Legal research for and drafting Rule 11 memo; review correspondence from Copyright Office regarding HTML code application; prepare and file response to Copyright Office inquiry; discuss Rule 11 memo with EM.	7.10	7.10
08/11/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Draft and revise Rule 11 memorandum; phone call with EM discussing same; revise memo.	8.20	8.20

08/12/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Legal research for Rule 11 memo; draft Rule 11 motion; draft letter enclosing motion and serve on opposing counsel; correspondence with client RE same.	4.60	4.60
08/14/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	File revised letter motion requesting extension of time to answer counterclaims with J. Pitman; review letter filed with court by opposing counsel; review order granting our motion from J. Pitman; correspond with client regarding same; correspond with contact at Vodafone regarding subpoena.	0.90	0.90
08/15/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding third party defrauded by defendants; correspondence with Vodafone regarding subpoena; correspond with client regarding same; correspondence with Stripe regarding subpoena; review Stripe's production of documents; correspond with client regarding same; serve Stripe production on opposing counsel; review spreadsheet from client; prepare information requested by Vodafone and send to Vodafone concerning our subpoena; phone call with client regarding all of the above.	3.40	3.40
08/16/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review court order; phone call with opposing counsel regarding consent to magistrate; review motion to dissolve filed by opposing counsel and supporting documents; phone call with client; draft response brief.	8.20	8.20
08/17/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Draft, revise, and file response brief arguing against motion to dissolve.	3.10	3.10
08/18/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review letter filed with chambers by opposing counsel; draft, revise, and file letter to chambers in response.	2.00	2.00
09/03/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review and respond to correspondence from CL regarding Rule 11 motion and procedure.	0.20	0.20
09/06/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with CL regarding Rule 11 Motion and Declaration; Draft brief in support of Rule 11 Motion; Draft Declaration for CL; PC with client regarding Declaration; send Declaration to CL for review and signature.	9.30	9.30
09/06/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review correspondence from Bluehost regarding FFLTrust.com; correspond with EM regarding same and send Order Dkt. No. 39 to forward to Bluehost.	0.30	0.30
09/07/2017	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding fake letter from FBI; discuss Rule 11 Motion and declaration with EM; revise and file Rule 11 motion, memo in support, and signed declaration from client.	1.50	1.50

09/07/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with opposing counsel regarding contemplated motion to extend time to respond to Answer and Counterclaims.	0.20	0.20
09/08/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review J. Pitman's Report and Recommendation regarding Plaintiff's motion to dissolve; legal research concerning J. Pitman's R&R.	2.40	2.40
09/08/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with Copyright Office regarding deposit for copyright application.	0.30	0.30
09/12/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Legal research relating to response objecting to J. Pitman's Report and Recommendation; drafting response objecting to R&R; correspondence with client regarding response to R&R and motion for an extension of time to file Motion to Dismiss; file motion to extend time to Answer; file memo objecting to R&R.	5.80	5.80
09/13/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review J. Pitman's order partially granting motion to extend time to Answer counterclaims; correspondence with client regarding same; discuss same with EM as well as strategy.	0.40	0.40
09/14/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review correspondence from client regarding J. Pitman's R&R; review research notes; correspond with client regarding same.	0.20	0.20
09/18/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding subpoenas; review various subpoenas and reminders; send additional reminder to AWS concerning subpoena.	0.30	0.30
09/18/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with EM regarding upcoming preliminary hearing; review opposing counsel's letter to J. Abrams regarding our objections to J. Pitman's R&R; begin drafting response to opposing counsel's letter.	1.80	1.80
09/19/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Correspondence with client regarding opposing counsel's requested extension of time to respond to Rule 11 motion; correspond with opposing counsel refusing consent to extension of time.	0.40	0.40
09/20/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review research notes and docket in preparation for hearing with J. Pitman.	2.00	2.00
09/21/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review notes for hearing; preliminary with J. Pitman; phone call with client discussing hearing and next steps; phone call with EM regarding protective order, discovery requests, and initial disclosures.	3.50	3.50

09/22/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review and revise draft proposed protective order and send to opposing counsel for review; review correspondence from client regarding initial disclosures; revise draft initial disclosures.	1.50	1.50
09/26/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review Judge's scheduling order; draft motion to dismiss counterclaims; discuss same with EM	5.40	5.40
09/27/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Phone call with EM discussing motion to dismiss counterclaims; draft motion to dismiss counterclaims; send draft portion of motion to dismiss to EM for review; draft revise and file motion to dismiss counterclaims.	7.10	7.10
10/02/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Draft, revise, and file motion to dismiss counterclaims; discuss same with EM.	10.80	10.80
10/02/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review opposing counsel's reply brief; discuss same with EM.	0.50	0.50
10/06/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review court order regarding discovery; discuss potential for expert witness with JAD and EM; prepare arguments for phone call with opposing counsel.	3.10	3.10
10/10/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review notes regarding court ordered phone call with opposing counsel; correspondence with opposing counsel regarding discovery; phone call with opposing counsel regarding ESI for discovery, protective order, and potential need for expert witness.	2.30	2.30
10/10/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Legal research regarding supplemental injunctive relief; correspondence with Amanda regarding research project for supplemental relief.	0.30	0.30
10/12/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Send letter and subpoena to updated Vodafone address; draft reply brief to opposing counsel's response to motion to dismiss; review opposing counsel's response to our motion for sanctions under Rule 11.	3.70	3.70
10/12/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review Defendants' response brief in opposition to our motion to dismiss; review case law cited by opposing counsel; discuss same with EM; correspondence with client.	6.20	6.20
10/16/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Draft Reply brief to response to Rule 11 motion for sanctions; legal research for same; discuss same with EM.	8.20	8.20

10/18/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Revise and file reply brief in support of motion to dismiss counterclaims; draft reply brief in support of rule 11 sanctions.	7.40	7.40
10/19/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Revise and file reply brief in support of motion to dismiss.	2.20	2.20
12/07/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review protective order and discovery responses; review discovery requests; discuss same with EM; correspondence with client regarding same.	1.10	1.10
AJD Total =				297.80	

~~Eric Misterovich~~

02/23/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review case file, emails with Brandon, begin outlining and drafting complaint, reviewing available causes of action.	3.30	3.30
02/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Continue reviewing file and drafting complaint, compiling and reviewing exhibits.	4.20	4.20
03/01/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Continue drafting complaint.	3.00	3.00
03/02/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Continue drafting complaint and email to client on same, emails and strategy review with attorney AJD.	3.00	3.00
03/08/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Edits to complaint and emails with Brandon, discuss procedure with Anderson, calls to SDNY re sealing process.	2.50	2.50

03/09/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review TRO motion and discuss same with AJD.	1.60	1.60
03/13/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review and revise TRO, TRO order, Motion to Seal, Sealing Order.	1.50	1.50
03/15/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Filing fee for complaint.	1.00	\$400.00
03/27/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review and revise supplemental brief, phone calls with AJD to discuss same.	3.30	3.30
03/31/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	PACER copying fees.	1.00	\$53.70
06/29/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review Response to TRO motion, phone call with attorney AJD, phone call with AJD and Brandon, review reply brief filed.	1.20	1.20
06/29/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with Brandon re settlement and email to Brandon and Anderson on same; alert Anderson re update prior to court appearance.	0.50	0.50
07/25/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Reviewing recent filings and discuss with attorney Duff.	0.30	0.30
07/26/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review counterclaim, review motion for injunction, draft response, legal research on same, discuss same with AJD.	5.20	5.20
07/26/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Discussing response strategy for TRO motion with attorney Duff.	1.00	1.00
07/27/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Legal research on first amendment defenses to defamation matters, review 9th circuit case law and application within the second circuit, in response to TRO motion.	2.50	2.50

07/27/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Continue draft response to motion for preliminary injunction, work with Rachel to review links provided by Milad, work with clerk on additional research, emails with Brandon, work with AJD on same.	5.50	5.50
07/28/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review orders and issues with AJD in prep for hearing, review subpoenas to PayPal, phone call with PayPal and discuss same with AJD.	1.00	1.00
08/01/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Phone call with Brandon, follow up email summarizing next steps, review email about locking domain names.	0.60	0.60
08/02/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review issues pertaining to <theunitutor.com> and phone calls to Fast Domain and emails to Bluehost, review of record and entered orders.	1.20	1.20
08/04/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review issues with AJD, review emails re settlement, phone call with BlueHost re locking the unitutor domain, drafting joint report for filing, phone call with Brandon on same.	1.70	1.70
08/09/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Respond to Brandon's email re Rule 11, phone call with Brandon re procedure, phone call with AJD regarding new procedure, review orders from the court regarding scheduling and consenting to magistrate.	1.20	1.20
08/10/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review counterclaim, legal research re antitrust claims, calls with AJD to discuss.	0.70	0.70
08/11/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review motion for sanctions, review answer, discuss strategy with AJD. Edit motion for sanctions.	1.20	1.20
08/17/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Review case status, docket, deadlines, and discuss with attorneys AJD and JAD.	0.20	0.20
09/06/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Email with Bluehost re keeping Unitutor on lock.	0.20	0.20
09/26/20 17	FFL123.co m	Federal Litigation	Outline and draft motion to dismiss.	6.00	6.00

09/27/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Continuing draft of motion to dismiss, review AJD brief.	5.00	5.00
10/10/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Additional research regarding injunction issues, discuss same with AJD.	4.30	4.30
10/24/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Review order re TRO, discuss same with AJD, email w Brandon on same.	0.50	0.50
12/18/2017	FFL123.com	Federal Litigation	Reviewing file and docket and review progression of case.	0.20	0.20

EM Total = 64.60

Total for All Attorneys = 362.40

